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Wirtschaftsförderungsgesellschaft
Südwestpfalz:
Partner of enterprises

We are dedicated to 
your success

We are looking forward to meeting you.

Hans Jörg Duppré
District Administrator 

„Enterprises create jobs, secure our prosperity and enrich 
our daily lives with innovative products and services. For 
this reason, the promotion of business is a top priority for 
us in the District of South-West Palatinate. The positive 
development of enterprise is a personal concern to me.“

Miriam Heinrich
MBA (University of Applied Sciences) 
Business Manager of 
Wirtschaftsförderungsgesellschaft
Südwestpfalz mbH

„A successful enterprise must address the needs of its 
customers quickly and flexibly. As an association for the 
promotion of business, we conform to this mode of wor-
king. We respond directly to requests and process any 
concern without red tape – so that the enterprises in the 
District have more time for their customers.“



Business site marketing 
Advice for subsidies 

Commercial spaces and properties 

Business development 

All-round support for start-ups 

We offer comprehensive advising to you, so that you 
can realise your good idea. We give you pointers for fi-
nancing, assist you with the formalities in the founding 
process, and help you prepare the business plan. Visit 
our seminars and presentations in preparation of your 
self-employment!

Support for business development

Even after the founding, we will always be there for you. 
Simply ask us if you would like to tap new sources of fi-
nancing, expand your enterprise or need cooperation 
partners for a project! If needed, we will also visit your 
business site. At our events, we take up topics that are 
important for your enterprise. 

Advising on subsidies 

There are many financing options for enterprises, but 
which one is the right one for you? We know the ins and 
outs of subsidies. Profit from our experience and sche-
dule an appointment!

Our service for you 

Procuring commercial spaces and properties 

Thanks to a wide selection of commercial spaces and 
properties, the District of South-West Palatinate offers 
diverse opportunities for entrepreneurial development. 
You can find a vast database for this purpose on our 
website. But we are also readily available for a personal 
meeting to advise you specifically for your needs.

Business site marketing 

South-West Palatinate is a living space for innovation. 
Therefore, we are campaigning actively together with 
enterprise, the District of South-West Palatinate and 
its member municipalities, as well as the City of Zwei-
brücken to professionally advertise the strengths of the 
region through the business location initiative of South-
West Palatinate. Everyone profits from this – the enter-
prises, residents and municipalities.

Together for a strong economy 
and a strong region 

To support enterprises actively, promote the founding 
of new businesses and provide professional support for 
businesses newly locating in the region, the District and 
the member municipalities agglomerated in it founded 
the non-profit business promotion association, Wirt-
schaftsförderungsgesellschaft Südwestpfalz in 1995. 

The shared goal: creation of a living space for innovati-
on, offering enterprises and residents optimal develop-
ment possibilities.

The stakeholders 

The stakeholders in the WFG are the District of South-
West Palatinate, the member municipalities (Dahner 
Felsenland, Hauenstein, Pirmasens-Land, Rodalben, 
Thaleischweiler-Fröschen-Wallhalben, Waldfischbach-
Burgalben, Zweibrücken-Land), the savings bank Spar-
kasse Südwestpfalz, VR-Bank eG Pirmasens, Raiffei-
sen- und Volksbank Dahn eG, VR-Bank Westpfalz and 
VR-Bank Südwestpfalz eG.

Start-up founding 


